NITIJELA OF THE MARSHALL ISLANDS.

4TH CONSTITUTIONAL REGULAR SESSION, 1983. BILL NO. 27/1981
N N.D.-1 ]
7 L o P.L. 1983-21

AN ACT

To amend the Trust Territory Social Security Act in order to provide
for increase in the guarterly taxable wages of employees; an

increase in the minimum quarters of coverage necessary in order to be
ifully insured” and ‘currently insured”: an increase in the penalty
for delinquent employers: and for related purposes.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE NITIJELA OF THE MARSHALL ISLANDS:

1 Section 1. Short title.
2 This Act may be cited as the Social Security (Amendment)
3 Act 1983.

Section 2. Interpretation.

In this Act -
"the Social Security Act™ means the Trust
Territory Social Security Act (YBATTC (1980 Edn.)) .

Section 3. Definitions.

OO0 3 Oy Ul

(1) Section 3(5) of the Soclal Security Act is amended
10 by omitting "one thousand two hundred dollars' (three times)

11  and substituting "one thousand five hundred dollars'.

12 (2) Section 3(7) of the Social Security Act 1s amended

12 by omitting from the defintion "Fully insured individual®

13 in Paragraph (a) "eight quarters"” and substituting "twelve quarters”.
14 (3) Section 3(7) of the Social Security Act is amended

15 by omitting from the definition “Currently insured individual”

16 in Paragraph (b) "six quarters” and substituting "“eight quarters”.

154



BILL NO. 27/1981
N.D.=-1
P.L. 1983-21

T TR T " Gk S S T

O @ ~3 O WU

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

Section 4., Violations: penalties.

Section 5(3) fof the Social Security Act is amended
by omitting "fifty dollars" and substituting "$250.00".

Section 5. Effective date.

(1) This Act shall not become effective unless Acts
to the same effect are passed by the 0lbiil Era Kelulau of the
Republic of Belau and the Congress of the Federated States of
Micronesia, and approved by the High Commissioner.

(2) Subject to Subsection (1), this Act becomes
effective on the date on which the last one of this Act and the
Acts referred to in Subsection (1) is approved by the High
Commissicner.

Certificate

I hereby certify:

(1) that the above iitijela Bill No. 27/1981 N.D.-1
has been passed by the Nitijela of the Marshall Islands on the
2nd day of February, 1983; and

(2) that I am satisfied that B11ll No. 27/1981 N.D.-l1 has
been passed in accordance with the Constitution of the Marshall
Islands and the Rules of the Nitijela.
I hereby place my signature before the Clerk of the Hitijela this

15th day of February, 1983.

/s/ Atlan Anien
Atlan Anien, Speaker
Nitijela of the Marshall Islands

i55



BILL NO. 27/1981
N.D.=1
P.L. 1983-21

oW o

o« —~3 (@) ul

Attest:

/s/ Donald F. Capelle

Donald F. Capelle,

Clerk
Nitijela of the Marshall Islands

Concurred by the High Commissioner Hon. Janet McCoy

3/9/83

156



